
 

 

 
 
 
 

 
RESOLUTION N° 007 

April 3rd, 2021 
 
By means of which article 1° of Resolution N° 002 of January 21st, 2021 is modified 
and the new date of the PAN AMERICAN ARTISTIC SKATING OF CLUBS AND 
NATIONS CHAMPIONSHIP 2020 is established. 
 
The President of World Skate America, in use of his legal attributions, statutory and; 
 

CONSIDERING 
 
That World Skate America by request of the Presidents of the National Federations 
extended the programming of the continental calendar 2020, until May 10th, 2021. 
 
That the Pan American Calendar 2020 foresees the holding of the PAN AMERICAN 
ARTISTIC SKATING OF CLUBS AND NATIONS CHAMPIONSHIP 2020, in the city of 
Guayaquil - Ecuador, from April 12th to 25th, 2021. 
 
That by Resolution N° 002 of January 21st, 2021, World Skate America modified the 
dates of registration and holding of the PAN AMERICAN ARTISTIC SKATING OF 
CLUBS AND NATIONS CHAMPIONSHIP 2020. 
 
Those guidelines and mobility restrictions have been issued in different countries of 
South America, with the purpose to protect the health of the citizens and thereby 
prevent infections as a result of the COVID 19 pandemic. 
 
That National Delegations registered for the Pan American event have reported 
difficulties due to the cancellation of scheduled flights and difficulties in obtaining 
airline tickets to attend the Pan American Championship. 
 
That the judges summoned to the event have reported difficulties in obtaining airline 
tickets to attend the Pan American Championship. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
That after consultation with the Presidents of WSA member countries, and in 
agreement with their respective governments, the need to postpone again the Pan 
American Artistic Skating Championship in Guayaquil, keeping the venue in this city, 
was raised. 
 
That in agreement with the Ecuadorian Skating Federation as the organizer of the 
Pan American Event, it has been decided to change the date of the Pan American 
Artistic Skating event, in order to comply with the guidelines of the health authorities 
regarding the pandemic and allow all registered countries to participate. 
 
That the Pan American Calendar 2020 foresees the holding of the PAN AMERICAN 
ARTISTIC SKATING OF CLUBS AND NATIONS CHAMPIONSHIP 2020, in the city of 
Guayaquil, Ecuador. 
 
That it is necessary to change the dates established in the articles of Resolution N° 
002 of January 21st, 2021, to allow the delegations of the different countries to 
participate in the Pan American event. 
 
  

RESOLVES 
 
ARTICLE 1° DATES OF THE CHAMPIONSHIP. Change the dates established in 
article 1° of Resolution N° 002 of January 21st, 2021, for the holding of the Pan 
American Artistic Skating of Clubs and Nations Championship 2020, which will be 
held from May 3rd to 9th, 2021, with the following schedule: 
 
 

DATES FOR THE PAN AMERICAN ARTISTIC SKATING OF CLUBS AND 
NATIONS CHAMPIONSHIP 2020 May 3rd to 9th, 2021  

Accreditations and Training May 3, 2021 

Pan American of Clubs and Nations – Simultáneo  May 3-9, 2021  

Clubs and Nations Competitions  May 4-9, 2021 

 
 
 
 



 

 

 
 
 
 
ARTICLE 2° REGISTRATION. In the event that a country or club needs to include 
new athletes interested in participating in the Pan American Artistic Skating 
Championships, they must apply directly to WSA General Secretariat for 
authorization. 
 
Paragraph. The deadline to do so will be until April 20th, 2021.  
 
ARTICLE 3° VALIDITY. This resolution shall be valid from the date of its issue.  
Issued this 3rd day of April 2020 at Bogotá D.C., city.  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
ALBERTO HERRERA AYALA                JORGE IVÁN ROLDAN PÉREZ 
        President                Secretary General 
 
 
 
                                   ANNICK TARVERNIERS 
                                 Artistic Technical Director WSA 


